LASQUETI ISLAND LOCAL TRUST COMMITTEE
BYLAW NO. 107

A BYLAW TO AMEND LASQUETI ISLAND LAND USE BYLAW NO. 78, 2005
The Lasqueti Island Local Trust Committee, being the Trust Committee having jurisdiction in respect
of the Lasqueti Island Local Trust Area under the Islands Trust Act, enacts as follows:

1. Citation

This bylaw may be cited for all purposes as “Lasqueti Island Land Use Bylaw No. 78, 2005,
Amendment No. 1, 2025”.

2. Lasquetilsland Local Trust Committee Bylaw No. 78, cited as “Lasqueti Island Land Use Bylaw No.
78, 2005”, is amended as per Schedule “1” attached to and forming part of this bylaw.

READ A FIRST TIME THIS 8™ DAY OF DECEMBER , 2025
READ A SECOND TIME THIS - DAY OF 20
PUBLIC HEARING HELD THIS - DAY OF 20
READ A THIRD TIME THIS DAY OF 20

APPROVED BY THE EXECUTIVE COMMITTEE OF THE ISLANDS TRUST THIS

DAY OF 20

ADOPTED THIS DAY OF 20

Chair Secretary



DRAFT BYLAW NO. 107 (LUB)
LASQUETI ISLAND LOCAL TRUST COMMITTEE
BYLAW NO. 107

Schedule “1”

1. Schedule “A” of Lasqueti Island Land Use Bylaw No. 78, 2005 is amended as follows:

1.1. PART 3 GENERAL PROVISIONS, Section 3.9. Dwellings and Guest Cabins Per Lot,
Subsection (2), Article (a) is amended by deleting “four (4) hectares (9.88 acres)” and
replacing it with “4.05 hectares”.

1.2. PART 3 GENERAL PROVISIONS, Section 3.10. Lots Divided by a Zone Boundary,
Subsection (1) is amended by deleting “four (4) hectares (9.88 acres)” and replacing
it with “4.05 hectares”.

1.3. PART 3 GENERAL PROVISIONS, Section 3.11. Subdivision Regulations, Subsection (1)
Parcel Area and Frontage, Article (a) is amended by deleting “4 hectares” and
replacing it with “4.05 hectares”.

1.4. PART 3 GENERAL PROVISIONS, Section 3.11. Subdivision Regulations, Subsection (3)
Parcel Area and Frontage is amended by deleting “4 hectares” and replacing it with
“4.05 hectares”.

1.5. PART 4 ZONE PROVISIONS CREATION OF ZONES, Section 4.5 Commercial 2 (C2),
Subsection (2) Maximum Number and Size of Buildings and Structures, Article (b) is
amended by deleting “four (4) hectares” and replacing it with “4.05 hectares”.

1.6. PART 4 ZONE PROVISIONS CREATION OF ZONES, Section 4.5 Commercial 2 (C2),
Subsection (2) Maximum Number and Size of Buildings and Structures, Article (f) is
amended by deleting “4 hectares” and replacing it with “4.05 hectares”.

1.7. PART 4 ZONE PROVISIONS CREATION OF ZONES, Section 4.6 Commercial 3 (C3),
Subsection (2) Maximum Number and Size of Buildings and Structures, Article (b),

Clause (ii) is amended by deleting “4 hectares (9.88) of parcel area over 4 hectares
(9.88)” and replacing it with “4.05 hectares of parcel area over 4.05 hectares”.

2. Schedule “C” of Lasqueti Island Land Use Bylaw No. 78, 2005 is amended as follows:

2.1 Schedule “C” —is amended by deleting “Subdivision District A (4 hectare minimum parcel
area)” and replacing it with “Subdivision District A (4.05 hectare minimum parcel area)”.

20f2



	A BYLAW TO AMEND LASQUETI island land use bylaw No. 78, 2005



